
Ferndale Road, Banstead



Guide Price £525,000

• Three bedrooms

• Semi Detached home

• Parking to the rear

• No ongoing chain

• En-suite to master

• Potential to extend STPP

• South facing garden

• Short walk to Banstead village

• Good school catchment

• Freehold

Freehold

The Personal Agent are delighted to present to the
market this three bedroom semi detached home in
Banstead ,located within a short walk of the village,
and comes to the market with no ongoing chain.

This wonderful home boasts bright and airy rooms
throughout, immediately apparent as you enter the
hallway via the porch, with doors leading into the first
reception room on the left hand side currently used as
dining room. The dining room has direct access to the
kitchen area, which has ample worktop and storage
space, along with a side door to the outside of the
property. The ground floor is completed by the
generously sized lounge / dining space, an ideal

entertaining area with French doors straight onto the
garden, and can also be extended STPP for further
accommodation.

Upstairs on the first floor there are two double
bedrooms as well as the family bathroom, with the
primary bedroom with en suite, located on the second
floor of the home.

Outside there a sunny South facing garden, with the
rarity in this location of having REAR PARKING access,
with the added possibility of adding an outbuilding /
office.

Banstead village is a short walk away and offers an
array of shops and restaurants. For the golf
enthusiasts, there are four world-renowned golf clubs,
Kingswood Golf and Country club, Surrey Downs,
Walton Heath and the RAC golf club all close by. 

Horse Riding schools and stabling can be found in
Kingswood, Chipstead, Tadworth and Walton on the
Hill. With many well regarded schools close by and
easy access to the M25, Banstead is growing more
popular by the day.

Tenure - Freehold
Council Tax Band - D










